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On the 27th of August 1893 a hurricane struck the South Carolina and Georgia Seacoast with such a massive
storm surge it created a phenomenon that was described as a “tidal wave” because it completely submerged
the low lying Georgia and South Carolina Sea Islands. Over 2,000 people perished and 30,000 more saw
their homes, barns, livestock and crops washed out to sea. The vast majority of victims were African-
American living under the “Jim Crow” system. Their plight became engulfed in a storm of politics and
charity. This well-researched book examines the storm and aftermath as well as the economics and social
history of one of the worst hurricanes in US History largely unknown and a mere footnote in most history
books. As an added bonus this book includes an interview and historical perspective by noted USC professor
and Historian Dr. Walter Edgar.
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From reader reviews:

Kellie Smith:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. To be sure that
book is very important usually. The book The Great Sea Islands Hurricane & Tidal Wave: A Storm of
Politics & Charity During the Jim Crow Era was making you to know about other know-how and of course
you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The publication The Great Sea Islands
Hurricane & Tidal Wave: A Storm of Politics & Charity During the Jim Crow Era is not only giving you far
more new information but also to get your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own
personal spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship with the book The Great Sea Islands
Hurricane & Tidal Wave: A Storm of Politics & Charity During the Jim Crow Era. You never truly feel lose
out for everything if you read some books.

Michael Mitchell:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different
to fill your own free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book may be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to test
look for book, may be the guide untitled The Great Sea Islands Hurricane & Tidal Wave: A Storm of Politics
& Charity During the Jim Crow Era can be good book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

James Scott:

Is it you actually who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Great Sea Islands Hurricane
& Tidal Wave: A Storm of Politics & Charity During the Jim Crow Era can be the reply, oh how comes? A
book you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this completely new era is common
not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Russell Fielder:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library as well
as to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real
their leisure activity. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time
there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring in
addition to can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important to suit
your needs. As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to
reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this The Great Sea Islands Hurricane & Tidal Wave: A Storm of Politics
& Charity During the Jim Crow Era can make you feel more interested to read.
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