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New Enlarged Edition The present selection is an attempt to represent the wide range and variety of Mulk
Raj Anands short stories. The first group represents the stories of lyric awareness. As in all poetry, the
themes are elemental, such as birth and death, beauty, love and childhood, and the treatment often reveals a
symbolic dimension added to realistic presentation. The prevailing mood of the second group of stories in
this selection is of the tears at the heart of things. These stories are naturally allied to the brief tales of lyric
awareness but with a difference. Through his acute understanding of the complex social forces at work,
Anand describes an India where tradition clashes with modernity. The range and variety of Anands short
stories are not only in mood, tone and spirit but also in locale, characters and form. The setting ranges from
the Punjab (as in The Parrot in the Cage) to Uttar Pradesh (as in The Price of Bananas) and Kashmir (as in
Kashmir Idyll). Both the village and the city get almost equal representation. Mulk Raj Anands stories are a
museum of human nature. Among the Indian writers of the short story in English, he has few peers.
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From reader reviews:

Royce Axtell:

The reserve with title Greatest Short Stories has a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a
lot of benefit after read this book. This kind of book exist new understanding the information that exist in
this book represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you within new era of the globalization. You can
read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Lucinda Brown:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends
and family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV,
or playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that's look different you can
read some sort of book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can
spent all day every day to reading a guide. The book Greatest Short Stories it is very good to read. There are
a lot of those who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In the event you
did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read
this book through your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book features high quality.

Sena Meyer:

The reason why? Because this Greatest Short Stories is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide
waiting for you to snap that but latter it will jolt you with the secret the item inside. Reading this book
adjacent to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such awesome way makes the content within
easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of rewards
than the other book get such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking method. So , still want to
hesitate having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Yolanda Matlock:

You can find this Greatest Short Stories by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing
it may to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various.
Not only through written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era like
now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your
own ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your
knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.
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