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What Exactly is the "Group" Bible?

The scenario: During Bible Study you read the questions, no one answers. You ask for comments. Nothing.
Then, you begin to notice that vacant look in people's eyes, and you think maybe it's time to break for
refreshments. That's because most "small group resources" fail to take one important thing into consideration
- the interaction of people in a group!

When people gather around the Word, with the right study materials, special things begin to happen. They
begin opening up. Caring for each other. Helping each other grow. And soon, they discover a new power in
their lives, and a new strength for living as the Holy Spirit carefully shapes them into a beautiful example of
community.

So if you've had enough of trying to make personal Bible studies work for your group, why not treat them to
a few sessions with the Serendipity Bible for Groups. This Bible has 30,000 questions, 60 Felt Needs
Courses, 200 Relational Bible Study Lessons, and 16 Topical Study Courses. It won't take long before you
discover what's made the Serendipity Bible one of the best-selling Bibles in the country!
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Tandy:

The book Serendipity Bible: New International Version (10th Anniversary Edition For Personal and Small
Group Study) gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable a
lot more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem with the
subject. If you can make reading through a book Serendipity Bible: New International Version (10th
Anniversary Edition For Personal and Small Group Study) being your habit, you can get considerably more
advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You could
know everything if you like start and read a guide Serendipity Bible: New International Version (10th
Anniversary Edition For Personal and Small Group Study). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science
e-book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this guide?

Lenore Cortez:

The book Serendipity Bible: New International Version (10th Anniversary Edition For Personal and Small
Group Study) can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So why must we leave
the best thing like a book Serendipity Bible: New International Version (10th Anniversary Edition For
Personal and Small Group Study)? Wide variety you have a different opinion about book. But one aim that
book can give many info for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer together with your book.
Knowledge or details that you take for that, you can give for each other; you are able to share all of these.
Book Serendipity Bible: New International Version (10th Anniversary Edition For Personal and Small Group
Study) has simple shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can appearance the
enormous world by wide open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Lynette Cavanaugh:

Serendipity Bible: New International Version (10th Anniversary Edition For Personal and Small Group
Study) can be one of your starter books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because
this publication has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit
entertaining but delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to get every word into pleasure
arrangement in writing Serendipity Bible: New International Version (10th Anniversary Edition For Personal
and Small Group Study) although doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest as well as based
confirm resource details that maybe you can be one among it. This great information can certainly drawn you
into brand-new stage of crucial contemplating.

Charlotte Cooper:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make someone
to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information easier to share.
You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You can



see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to your
account is Serendipity Bible: New International Version (10th Anniversary Edition For Personal and Small
Group Study) this publication consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. This
particular book was represented how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer use for
explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. This is why
this book acceptable all of you.
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