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Rory used to count down the days until she could leave, but now with a younger brother in tow, it would be
hard. She could never leave him. Rory is trapped in the Trailer Park like a princess in her tower, with her
mother playing the big bad, drunken, fire-breathing dragon. The dream of her knight coming to save her
faded away about the same time her goals changed. Feeling useless, and angry Rory starts her new school
and gets trampled by none other than the Monroe Falls Golden Boy, Tobias West. She finds herself seeing
him as the knight she dreamed of; though, she believes it to be just that, a dream. Tobias (Toby) is Mr.
Popular/ Mr. Perfect/ Mr. Money-in-the-bank. He is too high on the social ladder to step down to her level.
Or is he? Toby is smitten with Rory. Toby’s ex, Ashley, refuses to lose out to trailer park trash, and Rory
finds herself the fuel to Ashley’s newfound hate. On top of Monroe Falls High School drama, Rory still has
to deal with her drunken mother and needy brother. She doesn’t have time for childish games. Reality hits
Rory hard when her mother brings home a ticking time bomb for a bed mate and the need for that shiny
knight becomes real. Rome appears like she conjured him out of thin air with magical powers, and instantly
becomes her best friend. He seems to always be around when she needs someone to talk to and seems to
always know just how to fix it. (Did I mention he is drop dead beautiful?) Two knights in shining armor?
Nope!! That doesn’t happen. Not in fairy tales, and definitely not in real life. Rory finds herself realizing
there is a thin line between relationships and friendships, lines that are starting to blur. With Toby getting
ready to leave for college, Ashley’s nonstop meanness, and Rome showing up, can Rory handle the pressure?
Her old friend reality takes another whack at her, causing her dread and despair to take over. Rory is
questioning herself, and it's wreaking havoc on the strong girl she’s always considered herself to be. Have
her poor choices doomed her to life in the trailer park, or will she be able to exceed even her own
expectations? Will she ever realize she is truly a princess worthy of getting her prince? Or will she simply
survive? How does Rory’s story end?

This book is suited best for readers over the age of 17 due to sexual content and some language, as well as a
few different types of abuse that are rarely talked about: Verbal, Mental, and to some extent, Sexual and
Physical
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From reader reviews:

Brenda Taylor:

This Trailer Park Princess (Switching Tracks Series Book 1) are reliable for you who want to be described as
a successful person, why. The explanation of this Trailer Park Princess (Switching Tracks Series Book 1) can
be on the list of great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple reading food but feed an
individual with information that probably will shock your previous knowledge. This book is handy, you can
bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed types. Beside that this Trailer Park
Princess (Switching Tracks Series Book 1) giving you an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary,
giving you demo of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and luxuriate
in reading.

Ross Adams:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not seeking Trailer Park Princess
(Switching Tracks Series Book 1) that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading
this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world far
better then how they react toward the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading routine only for the
geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all of you who
want to start reading as your good habit, you may pick Trailer Park Princess (Switching Tracks Series Book
1) become your starter.

Jacqueline Britt:

Reading a book to become new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you examine
a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, in addition to
soon. The Trailer Park Princess (Switching Tracks Series Book 1) provide you with a new experience in
studying a book.

Elsie Hawkins:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen have to have book to know the up-date information of year for you to year. As we know those guides
have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world. From the
book Trailer Park Princess (Switching Tracks Series Book 1) we can take more advantage. Don't that you be
creative people? Being creative person must prefer to read a book. Only choose the best book that suitable
with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this time book Trailer Park Princess (Switching
Tracks Series Book 1). You can more pleasing than now.
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