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Darby Lane and Russell Gunn had been inseparable friends since their days in the Horseshoe, the wonderful
Baton Rouge neighborhood of their youth. But after graduate school, a tragic accident takes Russ's life -- and
Darby's world is shattered. Her long journey to healing brings her closer to Russ's brother Ben, whom she
begins to see through new eyes. Suddenly love blooms in the place of grief; and now, with the help of the
three wily and colorful aunts who raised her, Darby faces the challenge of reuniting Ben with his estranged
father -- if she and her aunts can get through the conniving schemes of Ben's social climber stepmother. Bit
by bit, Darby discovers that loss can build new life -- and love truly can conquer anything.
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From reader reviews:

Clara Lee:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading addiction give you
lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of guide you
read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with training books but if you want feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The particular Hey, Good Looking: A
Novel is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Janice Perry:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their very own reader
with their story or their experience. Not only the story that share in the books. But also they write about the
data about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors these days always try to improve
their skill in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of them is this
Hey, Good Looking: A Novel.

Kenneth Vargas:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you
can read some sort of book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent
all day long to reading a guide. The book Hey, Good Looking: A Novel it is very good to read. There are a
lot of those who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have
enough space bringing this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book
out of your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book features high quality.

Dallas Richardson:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or to make
summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real their
interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on
this period of time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this Hey, Good Looking: A Novel can make you really feel more interested to read.
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