
Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for 21st
Century Organizations

Aruna Rao, Joanne Sandler, David Kelleher, Carol Miller

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=1138910015
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=1138910015
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=1138910015


Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for 21st Century
Organizations

Aruna Rao, Joanne Sandler, David Kelleher, Carol Miller

Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for 21st Century Organizations Aruna Rao, Joanne Sandler,
David Kelleher, Carol Miller

At a time when some corporate women leaders are advocating for their aspiring sisters to ‘lean in’ for a
bigger piece of the existing pie, this book puts the spotlight on the deep structures of organizational culture
that hold gender inequality in place. Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for 21st Century Organizations
makes a compelling case that transforming the unspoken, informal institutional norms that perpetuate gender
inequality in organizations is key to achieving gender equitable outcomes for all.

The book is based on the authors’ interviews with 30 leaders who broke new ground on gender equality in
organizations, international case studies crafted from consultations and organizational evaluations, and
lessons from nearly fifteen years of experience of Gender at Work, a learning collaborative of 30 gender
equality experts. From the Dalit women’s groups in India who fought structural discrimination in the largest
‘right to work’ program in the world, to the intrepid activists who challenged the powerful members of the
UN Security Council to define mass rape as a tactic of war, the trajectories and analysis in this book will
inspire readers to understand and chip away at the deep structures of gender discrimination in organizational
policies, practices and outcomes.

Designed for practitioners, policy makers, donors, students and researchers looking at gender, development
and organizational change, this book offers readers a widely tested tool of analysis – the Gender at Work
Analytical Framework – to assess the often invisible structures of gender bias in organizations and to map
desired strategies and change processes.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Alexander:

What do you about book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy individual? If you don't have
spare time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have extra time? What did
you do? All people has many questions above. They should answer that question simply because just their
can do which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because
start from on pre-school until university need this specific Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for 21st
Century Organizations to read.

Lowell Oliver:

Here thing why this particular Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for 21st Century Organizations are
different and reputable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good however it depends in the content than
it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for 21st Century
Organizations giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any book out there but there is
no publication that similar with Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for 21st Century Organizations. It
gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing that happened in the world
which is probably can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in park your car, café,
or even in your technique home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe
the form of Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for 21st Century Organizations in e-book can be your
substitute.

Charlie Attwood:

Is it a person who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for
21st Century Organizations can be the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are
consequently out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd
activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Miranda Durkee:

You may get this Gender at Work: Theory and Practice for 21st Century Organizations by go to the
bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for the
knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by written or printed but also can you enjoy this
book by e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your
publication. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to
choose proper ways for you.
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