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This first translation of the complete poetry of Peruvian César Vallejo (1892-1938) makes available to
English speakers one of the greatest achievements of twentieth-century world poetry. Handsomely presented
in facing-page Spanish and English, this volume, translated by National Book Award winner Clayton
Eshleman, includes the groundbreaking collections The Black Heralds (1918), Trilce (1922), Human Poems
(1939), and Spain, Take This Cup from Me (1939).

Vallejo's poetry takes the Spanish language to an unprecedented level of emotional rawness and stretches its
grammatical possibilities. Striking against theology with the very rhetoric of the Christian faith, Vallejo's is a
tragic vision—perhaps the only one in the canon of Spanish-language literature—in which salvation and sin
are one and the same. This edition includes notes on the translation and a fascinating translation memoir that
traces Eshleman's long relationship with Vallejo's poetry. An introduction and chronology provide further
insights into Vallejo's life and work.
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From reader reviews:

Aaron Mullen:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV,
or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is look different
you can read a book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the
entire day to reading a publication. The book The Complete Poetry: A Bilingual Edition it is extremely good
to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book.
When you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore very
easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book has high quality.

Raymond Hernandez:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the spare time or they will get large
amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not just a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you possess
when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have read is
usually The Complete Poetry: A Bilingual Edition.

Perry Payne:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book especially book entitled The
Complete Poetry: A Bilingual Edition your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each
aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a
reserve then become one contact form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get prior to.
The The Complete Poetry: A Bilingual Edition giving you a different experience more than blown away your
thoughts but also giving you useful facts for your better life with this era. So now let us teach you the
relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished reading
through it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Dana Barker:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Complete Poetry: A
Bilingual Edition can be the respond to, oh how comes? A book you know. You are thus out of date,
spending your spare time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks
have than the others?
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