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Introduction to Computer Science Using Python: A Computational Problem-Solving Focus,recommended
by Guido van Rossum, the creator of Python (“This is not your average Python book…I think this book is a
great text for anyone teaching CS1”). With a focus on computational problem solving from Chapter 1, this
text provides numerous hands-on exercises and examples, each chapter ending with a significant-size
program demonstrating the step-by-step process of program development, testing, and debugging. A final
chapter includes the history of computing, starting with Charles Babbage, containing over 65 historical
images. An end-of-book Python 3 Programmers’ Reference is also included for quick lookup of Python
details. Extensive instructor materials are provided for those adopting for classroom use, including an
instructors’ manual, over 1,000 well-developed slides covering all fundamental topics of each chapter,
source code, and test bank. 
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From reader reviews:

Kent Dennis:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of many ways to share
the information as well as their idea. Second, looking at a book will make anyone more imaginative. When
you studying a book especially hype book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the people
do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Introduction to
Computer Science Using Python: A Computational Problem-Solving Focus, you are able to tells your family,
friends along with soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them
reading a e-book.

James Haney:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its cover may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer could be Introduction to Computer Science Using Python: A Computational
Problem-Solving Focus why because the fantastic cover that make you consider regarding the content will
not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your
reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Charles Shin:

Reading a book being new life style in this yr; every people loves to learn a book. When you learn a book
you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that
you have read. If you wish to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The
Introduction to Computer Science Using Python: A Computational Problem-Solving Focus provide you with
a new experience in reading through a book.

Clement Williams:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. That Introduction to Computer Science Using Python: A
Computational Problem-Solving Focus can give you a lot of buddies because by you checking out this one
book you have thing that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That book can be
one of one step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that might be your friend
doesn't recognize, by knowing more than some other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? We



should have Introduction to Computer Science Using Python: A Computational Problem-Solving Focus.
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