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The dark side of the Gilded Age is revealed in this vivid new view of turn-of-the-century New York. Scholar
of American culture M. H. Dunlop penetrates the psyche of New York City in the pivotal years made famous
by Edith Wharton, the Vanderbilts, and the Rockefellers, unveiling an age that was not genteel and proper
but dangerous and predatory.

Drawing on rare primary sources, Dunlop showcases the sensational and surreal events of the times -- from a
wealthy society wedding where locals were trampled in their frenzy to watch, to the harrowing nine-hour
execution of a zoo elephant diagnosed with sexual frustration, and more. Spiced with cameos of such
characters as Stanford White, William Merritt Chase, the Midnight Band of Mercy, and exotic dancer Little
Egypt, Gilded City brings to life a key era that saw the city rise to dominance in America.
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From reader reviews:

Rose Cotner:

This Gilded City: Scandal and Sensation in Turn-of-the-Century New York book is not really ordinary book,
you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is actually
information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you actually
read a lot of information you will get. This specific Gilded City: Scandal and Sensation in Turn-of-the-
Century New York without we realize teach the one who looking at it become critical in thinking and
analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Gilded City: Scandal and Sensation in Turn-of-the-Century New York
can bring when you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it
inside your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Gilded City: Scandal and Sensation in Turn-of-the-
Century New York having great arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not truly feel
uninterested in reading.

Dean Rakestraw:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys this
particular aren't like that. This Gilded City: Scandal and Sensation in Turn-of-the-Century New York book is
readable by simply you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
reading experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer
involving Gilded City: Scandal and Sensation in Turn-of-the-Century New York content conveys thinking
easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just
different such as it. So , do you even now thinking Gilded City: Scandal and Sensation in Turn-of-the-
Century New York is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Claudia Butler:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or
all their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic inside
the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to
fill your free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book is usually option to fill your totally free time/
holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to test
look for book, may be the publication untitled Gilded City: Scandal and Sensation in Turn-of-the-Century
New York can be great book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Mamie Contreras:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Gilded City: Scandal and Sensation in Turn-
of-the-Century New York can be the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of
date, spending your time by reading in this brand new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
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