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In the exclusive, glittering world of business superstars, Nick Sinclair was a legend...
The ruggedly handsome president of Global Industries handled his business the way he handled his women -
- with charm, daring and ruthless self-control. A man used to the very best, Nick hired Lauren Danner, and
assumed the proud beauty would soon be another easy conquest. But Lauren's flashing wit and rare spirit
dazzled him -- and slowly, against his will, he was intrigued, challenged -- and in love.
Yet Lauren was living a lie, a charade that became more dangerous with every passing moment. Trapped in a
web of deceit, she fought her growing love for Nick. Her secret could destroy his fragile trust -- and the
promise of life with the most compelling man she had ever met!
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From reader reviews:

Juan Elam:

This Double Standards tend to be reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The key
reason why of this Double Standards can be on the list of great books you must have is giving you more than
just simple examining food but feed you with information that might be will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your
conditions in the e-book and printed versions. Beside that this Double Standards forcing you to have an
enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we all know it useful
in your day action. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Thomas Baldwin:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, going to beach,
or picnic in the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book might be option to fill your free
of charge time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should
read. If you want to try look for book, may be the book untitled Double Standards can be fine book to read.
May be it could be best activity to you.

Emma Anderson:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get wide range
of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you possess
when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading textbooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the actual book you have read is
usually Double Standards.

Barbara Rubio:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from your book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update
of news. In this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the Double Standards when you necessary it?
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