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Fans of Tomie dePaola s kindly Strega Nona will love this charming look at the early days of her good-
hearted but clumsy helper Big Anthony. From the day he is born, Big Anthony never pays attention. As a
boy, he leaves the gates of the farm open and all the animals escape. As a young man off to make his fortune
in the world, he accidentally fixes the leaning Tower of Pisa. Will Italy survive the hilarious mishaps of Big
Anthony? Readers of all ages can be grateful that dePaola continues to practice his magic so well. The New
York Times Book Review Big Anthony and Strega Nona certainly qualify as celebrities in the realm of
picture books, and this latest installment will bring smiles to the faces of their young fans. School Library
Journal"
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From reader reviews:

Amber Orlowski:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what
kind of guide you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really
feel happy read one together with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The particular [(Big
Anthony: His Story )] [Author: Tomie De Paola] [Nov-2001] is kind of e-book which is giving the reader
erratic experience.

Wayne Santiago:

This [(Big Anthony: His Story )] [Author: Tomie De Paola] [Nov-2001] is great guide for you because the
content which is full of information for you who also always deal with world and possess to make decision
every minute. This specific book reveal it information accurately using great arrange word or we can claim
no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't
mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but hard core information with beautiful delivering
sentences. Having [(Big Anthony: His Story )] [Author: Tomie De Paola] [Nov-2001] in your hand like
finding the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no reserve that offer you world
throughout ten or fifteen moment right but this reserve already do that. So , this really is good reading book.
Heya Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt that will?

Susan Tokarz:

The book untitled [(Big Anthony: His Story )] [Author: Tomie De Paola] [Nov-2001] contain a lot of
information on the item. The writer explains the woman idea with easy approach. The language is very
straightforward all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was written by famous
author. The author will take you in the new era of literary works. You can actually read this book because
you can read on your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you
want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice read.

Joseph Vargas:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of news. With
this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social similar
to newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking for
the [(Big Anthony: His Story )] [Author: Tomie De Paola] [Nov-2001] when you needed it?
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