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After narrowly escaping the Shiryaevo Vault, Nathan O’Brien is on the run, adapting to life without Jennifer
Logan. In his possession: a powerful mind control device known as the Histeridae and evidence of the
Hibernation Program’s true agenda.

Beginning with George Mohanty and his words ‘Death is a relative term’, he must unravel the mystery of the
Histeridae. But Nathan is on borrowed time, trapped inside a body that was never supposed to last. Can he
bring back the woman he loves and expose the truth before it’s too late, or will the past finally catch up with
him?

From the mountains of India to the futuristic streets of London and Dubai, The Embers of Hope is the
thrilling second instalment in the Hibernation saga.

It features conspiracy theories, romance and intrigue and is set in a dystopian world, making it an ideal read
for any fans of the sci-fi genre and also suitable for a young adult audience.
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Conway:

Book is written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a e-book. Book
has a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Close to
that you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve The Embers of Hope: A science-fiction thriller
(Hibernation Series Book 2) will make you to become smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can
know about anything. But some of you think which open or reading any book make you bored. It's not make
you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you in search of best book or acceptable book with you?

John Harris:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material if you want something
to explain what you problem? How about your time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have spare time to
perform others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have extra time? What did
you do? All people has many questions above. They must answer that question mainly because just their can
do which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable. Because start from on
jardín de infancia until university need this The Embers of Hope: A science-fiction thriller (Hibernation
Series Book 2) to read.

Judy Brewer:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of various ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make an individual more imaginative.
When you studying a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to imagine the story how
the people do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read this The
Embers of Hope: A science-fiction thriller (Hibernation Series Book 2), you are able to tells your family,
friends in addition to soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a
guide.

Donna Canales:

A lot of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book The Embers of Hope: A science-
fiction thriller (Hibernation Series Book 2) to make your personal reading is interesting. Your skill of reading
skill is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy you just read it
and mingle the feeling about book and reading especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to start a
book and learn it. Beside that the reserve The Embers of Hope: A science-fiction thriller (Hibernation Series
Book 2) can to be your new friend when you're experience alone and confuse with what must you're doing of



these time.
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