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As Davis Love III walked the fairways of the Oakland Hills Country Club, in contention during the final
round of the 1996 U.S. Open Championship, he had a powerful ally on his side. For the rest of the nation the
day may have been Father's Day, but for Love every day on a golf course is father's day.
It was Davis Love, Jr., master professional and legendary teacher, who taught his son the game in all its
beautiful complexity. As a child, Davis III was encouraged just to play, to enjoy the game as he grew and
developed his athletic skills, to find the pleasure in the game that can lead to the desire for improvement. But
when, early in his teens, Davis III declared himself ready to take golf seriously, to put in the time to learn
and understand the physical and mental components of the game that turn a golfer into a champion, his father
was delighted, determined, and ready.
With every shot he takes, Davis Love III provides a tribute to the strength and the value of his father's
teachings. And in Every Shot I Take, he shares with us the lessons he learned about how to play golf with
power, with skill, and with joy. Those lessons range widely, from the psychological ("Let your attitude
determine your golf game; don't let your golf game determine your attitude") to the physical ("To hit the ball
far, hit the ball straight; I try to hit the ball at 80 percent of my overall power, because at 80 percent I have a
much better chance of hitting the ball with the center of the clubface") to the technical ("When you begin
your downswing, and your left foot returns to the ground, put your cleats in the same holes they were in
originally"). They include drills like the Hitchhike Drill, where you place your right hand behind your back
and your left thumb on your right shoulder, then in a spinning motion move your thumb to your left shoulder
-- that's the golf swing in miniature! There are the Ten Commandments of Putting, six steps to successful
long bunker shots, and tips for playing in the wind and rain, on fast greens, or out of long rough. Yet all are
ultimately about something more than golf.
Golf was, for Davis, Jr., a way of being a father, of teaching his sons how to learn, how to approach whatever
they might choose to do with knowledge and with care, how to overcome obstacles through dedication and
understanding. It was the vehicle through which he taught the most important lesson of all: "Follow your
dream, and enjoy the trip."
Through this moving tribute to his father's love, Davis III passes along the benefits of those lessons in a gem
of a book that will improve your golf game -- and enhance your life.
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From reader reviews:

Esther Cunningham:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the title Every Shot I
Take suitable to you? Often the book was written by popular writer in this era. The actual book untitled
Every Shot I Takeis the one of several books that will everyone read now. This particular book was inspired
many men and women in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new age that you ever know
prior to. The author explained their concept in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to recognise
the core of this publication. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To
help you to see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Reta Zimmer:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Every Shot I Take e-book written by well-
known writer whose to say well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who have read the
book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate
your hunger then you still uncertainty Every Shot I Take as good book not simply by the cover but also
through the content. This is one reserve that can break don't evaluate book by its cover, so do you still
needing a different sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so
why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Chad Wood:

This Every Shot I Take is great guide for you because the content and that is full of information for you who
have always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it info
accurately using great manage word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read the
item hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but
tricky core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Every Shot I Take in your hand like getting
the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no publication that offer you world
throughout ten or fifteen moment right but this publication already do that. So , this is good reading book.
Hello Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that will?

Nancy Sherman:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt this when they get
a half elements of the book. You can choose often the book Every Shot I Take to make your current reading
is interesting. Your current skill of reading proficiency is developing when you including reading. Try to
choose easy book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the opinion about book and reading especially. It
is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and learn it. Beside that the book Every Shot I Take
can to be a newly purchased friend when you're experience alone and confuse in what must you're doing of
that time.
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