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Helena Rubinstein (1872–1965), the great 20th-century cosmetics entrepreneur, changed the way women
saw themselves, using her own remarkable life and spectacular art collections as a model. Rubinstein broke
free from the constraints of her 19th-century, small-town, Polish Jewish background to become a giant of the
beauty industry and an international household name. A key figure in the development of modern taste and
style, she produced and marketed the means for ordinary women to assert their own individuality. Through
her conception of the beauty salon as a place of modernist display, she empowered the modern woman to
define herself through her choices in taste and decor.
 
Helena Rubinstein: Beauty Is Power traces the path of this remarkable early feminist and visionary art
patron. In Rubinstein’s world, art and commerce blended seamlessly. She ornamented her salons and homes
with splendid artworks—Surrealist murals, modernist portraits, Art Deco furniture, Venetian mirrors, and
one of the era’s great collections of African and Oceanic art. Her understanding of beauty was similarly
expansive and democratic: she saw the face as the site for self-expression and the exploration of identity. The
Rubinstein beauty program thus included not only makeup and hairdressing, but also lessons in health,
deportment, and culture. Such features, innovative at the time and wildly popular, today provide a fascinating
glimpse into popular culture as it affected women in the 20th century.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa McCann:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Helena Rubinstein: Beauty Is Power (Jewish Museum).
Try to face the book Helena Rubinstein: Beauty Is Power (Jewish Museum) as your close friend. It means
that it can to become your friend when you really feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter
than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you far more confidence because you can
know everything by the book. So , let me make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Sang O\'Connor:

Throughout other case, little persons like to read book Helena Rubinstein: Beauty Is Power (Jewish
Museum). You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Given that we know about how is
important some sort of book Helena Rubinstein: Beauty Is Power (Jewish Museum). You can add knowledge
and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can
understand everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple
matter until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or searching by
internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's read.

Patrick Myers:

The book Helena Rubinstein: Beauty Is Power (Jewish Museum) can give more knowledge and also the
precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the great thing like a
book Helena Rubinstein: Beauty Is Power (Jewish Museum)? A few of you have a different opinion about e-
book. But one aim this book can give many details for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer
together with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you
may share all of these. Book Helena Rubinstein: Beauty Is Power (Jewish Museum) has simple shape but the
truth is know: it has great and large function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide open
and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Jennifer Witherspoon:

This book untitled Helena Rubinstein: Beauty Is Power (Jewish Museum) to be one of several books that will
best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit upon
it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retail store or you can order it by way of online.
The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, because you can read
this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this publication from your list.
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