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Bataan, the last bastion stemming the Japanese tidal wave across the Pacific, was about to fall. In the midst
of crashing bombs and depleted stores, the vastly outnumbered lines broke and commands disintegrated.
Only one unit, 'Old Two Hon'erd,' a small band of New Mexico National Guardsmen, remained intact. With
only rifles, a few rounds of ammunition, and an unshakable esprit de corps, they prepared to die but not
surrender. In her award-winning history, Dorothy Cave follows the members of a small unit who played a
key role in this pivotal moment in history. They were the first unit to fire when the Japanese struck. They
guarded the bridges of the strategic retreat as all others crossed into Bataan to make the now-famous stand.
They were the last to lay down arms, and did so only when ordered by the high command. Then followed the
Death March, starvation, and brutality of Japanese POW camps and Hell Ships. Laughing at their captors,
they sabotaged the Japanese war machine at every chance. They were still fighting in Uncle Sam's army and
only half returned. Amid human depravity, described in graphic detail, they kept their faith, honor, and a
profound love of their country. Theirs is a legacy of courage and something beyond.
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From reader reviews:

Connie Simpson:

This book untitled Beyond Courage (Newly Revised) to be one of several books that will best seller in this
year, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy
this specific book in the book retailer or you can order it by means of online. The publisher on this book sells
the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smartphone.
So there is no reason to you to past this publication from your list.

Gertrude Barrett:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Beyond Courage (Newly Revised)
guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that could be understand by
anyone who all read the book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and
composing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still question Beyond Courage (Newly
Revised) as good book not only by the cover but also by the content. This is one publication that can break
don't ascertain book by its handle, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come
on your studying sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Danny Johnson:

You can get this Beyond Courage (Newly Revised) by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or
reviewing it may to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are
various. Not only simply by written or printed but can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era
like now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose
your current ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately
make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Teresa Spillman:

Some people said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the idea when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book Beyond Courage (Newly Revised) to make your
personal reading is interesting. Your skill of reading talent is developing when you like reading. Try to
choose basic book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the impression about book and looking at
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open up a book and examine it. Beside that the
publication Beyond Courage (Newly Revised) can to be your new friend when you're sense alone and
confuse using what must you're doing of this time.
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