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In this masterful compilation, world-recognized discographer Chris Sheridan draws together the most
comprehensive reconstruction of Thelonious Monk's performances and recordings. Woven through the
chronological listing of Monk's work is the story of his rise to acceptance as one of the key pianists and
composers of jazz and his decline in health and popularity to his death in 1982.

Following a Prologue which attempts to summarize the career and man, the narrative discography covers
Monk's entire performance career. This is followed by appendixes listing all microgroove and post-
microgroove issues of Monk's performances, all known commercially produced films and videos in which
Monk took part, a listing of all of his engagements from 1944 until his career petered out in the mid-1970s,
and a bibliography. The work concludes with an index of the people, places, producers, and radio and
television programs referred to or quoted in the main taxt, a listing of all musicians, vocalists, and broadcast
presenters who took part in the recordings or who played in Monk's bands, an index of all the titles used for
Monk's tunes by other musicians and vocalists, and a listing of all tunes played, together with their
composers and, where relevant, lyricists. A comprehensive reference work for all scholars and other
researchers involved with jazz from the 1940s onward.

 Download Brilliant Corners: A Bio-Discography of Thelonious ...pdf

 Read Online Brilliant Corners: A Bio-Discography of Thelonio ...pdf

http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0313302391
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0313302391
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0313302391
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0313302391
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0313302391
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0313302391
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0313302391
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0313302391


Download and Read Free Online Brilliant Corners: A Bio-Discography of Thelonious Monk
(Discographies: Association for Recorded Sound Collections Discographic Reference) Chris Sheridan

From reader reviews:

Ida Torres:

The book Brilliant Corners: A Bio-Discography of Thelonious Monk (Discographies: Association for
Recorded Sound Collections Discographic Reference) can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Why then must we leave a very important thing like a book Brilliant Corners: A Bio-
Discography of Thelonious Monk (Discographies: Association for Recorded Sound Collections
Discographic Reference)? Wide variety you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim this
book can give many details for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer together with your book.
Knowledge or information that you take for that, you may give for each other; you can share all of these.
Book Brilliant Corners: A Bio-Discography of Thelonious Monk (Discographies: Association for Recorded
Sound Collections Discographic Reference) has simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for
you. You can seem the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Delores Moretti:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the idea for
a while is reading. Sure, by reading a publication your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay
than other is high. For yourself who want to start reading a new book, we give you that Brilliant Corners: A
Bio-Discography of Thelonious Monk (Discographies: Association for Recorded Sound Collections
Discographic Reference) book as nice and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more than just a
book.

Sang Weems:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Brilliant Corners: A Bio-Discography of
Thelonious Monk (Discographies: Association for Recorded Sound Collections Discographic Reference) can
be the response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your time
by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Phillis Ries:

In this particular era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you need to do
is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of several
books in the top checklist in your reading list is Brilliant Corners: A Bio-Discography of Thelonious Monk
(Discographies: Association for Recorded Sound Collections Discographic Reference). This book and that is
qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking upwards and



review this book you can get many advantages.
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