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One rainy day, Sylvester finds a magic pebble that can make wishes come true. But when a lion frightens
him on his way home, Sylvester makes a wish that brings unexpected results. How Sylvester is eventually
reunited with his loving family and restored to his own donkey self makes a story that is beautifully tender
and perfectly joyful.
Illustrated with William Steig's glowing pictures, this winner of the 1970 Caldecott Medal is a modern
classic beloved by children everywhere. Now reissued to celebrate the discovery of the original artwork, this
deluxe edition contains painstakingly careful color corrections made from those watercolor originals -- the
color you'll see within this book is as Mr. Steig had originally intended it to be. It also features his moving
Caldecott Medal acceptance speech.
The New York Times Book Review wrote of Mr. Steig that "everything he does is magic." This deluxe edition
of Sylvester and the Magic Pebble truly recaptures that magic for a whole new generation of readers.
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From reader reviews:

Michelle Huffman:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite reserve and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Sylvester and the Magic Pebble. Try to make the book
Sylvester and the Magic Pebble as your good friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you truly
feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you
personally. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let
me make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Kevin Porter:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading addiction give you lot of
advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book
that will improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of publication
you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel happy read
one with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the Sylvester and the Magic Pebble is
kind of reserve which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Debbie Allen:

The book untitled Sylvester and the Magic Pebble is the guide that recommended to you to study. You can
see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you actually. The language that creator use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of exploration when write the
book, to ensure the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of
Sylvester and the Magic Pebble from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Diana Keller:

Beside this particular Sylvester and the Magic Pebble in your phone, it could give you a way to get nearer to
the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from oven so don't
become worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Sylvester and
the Magic Pebble because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you occasionally
have book but you would not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you
have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful
island. Techniques you still want to miss it? Find this book and read it from today!
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