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Essays on Eddic Poetry presents a selection of important articles on Old Norse literature by noted
medievalist John McKinnell. While McKinnell’s work addresses many of the perennial issues in the study of
Old Norse, this collection has a special focus on the interplay between heathen and Christian world-views in
the poems.

Among the texts examined are Hávamál, which includes an elegantly cynical poem about Óðinn’s sexual
intrigues and a more mystical one about his self-sacrifice on the world-tree in order to gain magical wisdom;
V?lundarkviða, which recounts an elvish smith’s revenge for his captivity and maiming; and Hervararkviða,
where the heroine bravely but foolishly raises her dead father to demand the deadly sword Tyrfingr from
him.

Originally published between 1988 and 2008, these twelve essays cover a wide range of mythological and
heroic poems and have been revised and updated to reflect the latest scholarship.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Reed:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled Essays on Eddic Poetry (Toronto Old Norse-Icelandic Series (TONIS)).
Try to make book Essays on Eddic Poetry (Toronto Old Norse-Icelandic Series (TONIS)) as your friend. It
means that it can to be your friend when you feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than in the
past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you
can know anything by the book. So , we need to make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Chad Brown:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what yours problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy individual? If you
don't have spare time to do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have free
time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question since
just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this kind of Essays on Eddic Poetry (Toronto
Old Norse-Icelandic Series (TONIS)) to read.

Kay Young:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as compared to
can satisfy your short time to read it because all this time you only find publication that need more time to be
read. Essays on Eddic Poetry (Toronto Old Norse-Icelandic Series (TONIS)) can be your answer given it can
be read by a person who have those short time problems.

Anita Cannon:

Beside this particular Essays on Eddic Poetry (Toronto Old Norse-Icelandic Series (TONIS)) in your phone,
it could give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or information. The information and the
knowledge you may got here is fresh in the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an old people
live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Essays on Eddic Poetry (Toronto Old Norse-Icelandic
Series (TONIS)) because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you sometimes
have book but you would not get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have
this in the hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island.
Techniques you still want to miss it? Find this book and also read it from at this point!
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