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With the overwhelming amount of new information that bombards us each day, it is perhaps difficult to
imagine a time when the widespread availability of the printed word was a novelty. In early nineteenth-
century Britain, print was not novel—Gutenberg’s printing press had been around for nearly four
centuries—but printed matter was still a rare and relatively expensive luxury. All this changed, however, as
publishers began employing new technologies to astounding effect, mass-producing instructive and
educational books and magazines and revolutionizing how knowledge was disseminated to the general
public.

In Steam-Powered Knowledge, Aileen Fyfe explores the activities of William Chambers and the W. & R.
Chambers publishing firm during its formative years, documenting for the first time how new technologies
were integrated into existing business systems. Chambers was one of the first publishers to abandon
traditional skills associated with hand printing, instead favoring the latest innovations in printing processes
and machinery: machine-made paper, stereotyping, and, especially, printing machines driven by steam
power. The mid-nineteenth century also witnessed dramatic advances in transportation, and Chambers used
proliferating railway networks and steamship routes to speed up communication and distribution. As a result,
his high-tech publishing firm became an exemplar of commercial success by 1850 and outlived all of its
rivals in the business of cheap instructive print. Fyfe follows Chambers’s journey from small-time bookseller
and self-trained hand-press printer to wealthy and successful publisher of popular educational books on both
sides of the Atlantic, demonstrating along the way the profound effects of his and his fellow publishers’
willingness, or unwillingness, to incorporate these technological innovations into their businesses.
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From reader reviews:

Susan Gagnon:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic inside
the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your
personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book might be option to fill your no cost time/ holiday. The
first thing you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try look for book, may be
the publication untitled Steam-Powered Knowledge: William Chambers and the Business of Publishing,
1820-1860 can be very good book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Theresa Diaz:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its include
may doesn't work here is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in
the outside search likes. Maybe you answer might be Steam-Powered Knowledge: William Chambers and
the Business of Publishing, 1820-1860 why because the fantastic cover that make you consider regarding the
content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or maybe
cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Jean Willis:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-book
technique, more simple and reachable. This kind of Steam-Powered Knowledge: William Chambers and the
Business of Publishing, 1820-1860 can give you a lot of friends because by you taking a look at this one
book you have thing that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This book can be one
of a step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't recognize,
by knowing more than various other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have Steam-
Powered Knowledge: William Chambers and the Business of Publishing, 1820-1860.

Dolores Mann:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is known as of book
Steam-Powered Knowledge: William Chambers and the Business of Publishing, 1820-1860. Contain your
knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make anyone happier to
read. It is most critical that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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