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Stitch...stuff...and fancy up your bath tissue with amigurumi! Enjoy the fun of amigurumi-style crochet to
create adorable toilet paper covers that are quick-and-easy to make...and cute-as-ever to display! More than
30 cheerful patterns are provided that children and adults alike will love. This whimsical collection includes
farm animals, popular pets, dinosaurs, a monster and Sock Monkey; a cherry-topped cupcake, candle-topped
cake, cup of coffee and sushi roll; a sunflower and a pot of violets. Holiday patterns include a Santa Hat,
Jack O'Lantern and bunny. More surprises include an alien, robot and train. Amigurumi toilet paper covers
are fun to make for yourself and perfect for gifts. These are beginner's level projects made mostly with the
simple single crochet stitch. Color photos, stitch tutorials, amigurumi basics and full-size templates are
included.
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From reader reviews:

Stephanie Sellers:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled Amigurumi Toilet Paper Covers: Cute Crocheted Animals, Flowers,
Food, Holiday Decor and More!. Try to stumble through book Amigurumi Toilet Paper Covers: Cute
Crocheted Animals, Flowers, Food, Holiday Decor and More! as your friend. It means that it can to be your
friend when you truly feel alone and beside that of course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for you. The book makes you more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So ,
we need to make new experience and knowledge with this book.

James Buscher:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time
to take a go walking, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book entitled
Amigurumi Toilet Paper Covers: Cute Crocheted Animals, Flowers, Food, Holiday Decor and More!?
Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time together with your
favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have some
other opinion?

Francisco Garcia:

The book Amigurumi Toilet Paper Covers: Cute Crocheted Animals, Flowers, Food, Holiday Decor and
More! make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable much more increase.
Book can to be your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem using your subject. If you can
make examining a book Amigurumi Toilet Paper Covers: Cute Crocheted Animals, Flowers, Food, Holiday
Decor and More! to be your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your current capable, increase
your knowledge about some or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open and read a e-book
Amigurumi Toilet Paper Covers: Cute Crocheted Animals, Flowers, Food, Holiday Decor and More!. Kinds
of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about
this book?

Vincent Humphreys:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is known
as of book Amigurumi Toilet Paper Covers: Cute Crocheted Animals, Flowers, Food, Holiday Decor and
More!. You can include your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could possibly add your
knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about e-book. It



can bring you from one place to other place.
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