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Remember the wonderfully romantic book of love letters that Carrie reads aloud to Big in the recent
blockbuster film, Sex and the City? Fans raced to buy copies of their own, only to find out that the beautiful
book didn't actually exist. However, since all of the letters referenced in the film did exist, we decided to
publish this gorgeous keepsake ourselves.
Love Letters of Great Men follows hot on the heels of the film and collects together some of history's most
romantic letters from the private papers of Beethoven, Mark Twain, Mozart, and Lord Byron. For some of
these great men, love is "a delicious poison" (William Congreve); for others, "a nice soft wife on a sofa with
good fire, & books & music" (Charles Darwin). Love can scorch like the heat of the sun (Henry VIII), or
penetrate the depths of one's heart like a cooling rain (Flaubert). Every shade of love is here, from the
exquisite eloquence of Oscar Wilde and the simple devotion of Robert Browning, to the wonderfully modern
misery of the Roman Pliny the Younger, losing himself in work to forget how much he misses his beloved
wife, Calpurnia.
Taken together, these letters show that perhaps men haven't changed all that much over the last 2,000 years--
passion, jealousy, hope and longing still rule their hearts and minds. In an age of e-mail and texted "i luv u"s,
this timeless and unique collection reminds us that nothing can compare to the simple joy of sitting down to
read a letter from the one you love.
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From reader reviews:

Dale Fain:

This Love Letters of Great Men book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your
hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is actually information inside this e-book incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. This
particular Love Letters of Great Men without we understand teach the one who examining it become critical
in pondering and analyzing. Don't be worry Love Letters of Great Men can bring any time you are and not
make your carrier space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop
even telephone. This Love Letters of Great Men having very good arrangement in word as well as layout, so
you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Curtis Phillips:

The event that you get from Love Letters of Great Men could be the more deep you excavating the
information that hide within the words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this
book is hard to know but Love Letters of Great Men giving you excitement feeling of reading. The copy
writer conveys their point in certain way that can be understood by anyone who read the idea because the
author of this book is well-known enough. That book also makes your vocabulary increase well. It is
therefore easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
highly recommend you for having this Love Letters of Great Men instantly.

Roger Richmond:

Precisely why? Because this Love Letters of Great Men is an unordinary book that the inside of the book
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will distress you with the secret this inside. Reading this book adjacent
to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such wonderful way makes the content inside of easier
to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this any longer or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of gains than the other
book possess such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking method. So , still want to hold
off having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Meghan Drucker:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This guide Love Letters of Great Men was filled in relation to science. Spend
your time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has different feel when they
reading any book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the
modern era like at this point, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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