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Great writers of the past whose works we still read and love will be read forever. They will survive the test
of time. We remember authors of true genius because their writings are simply the best. Or . . . might there
be other reasons that account for an author’s literary fate?
 
This original book takes a fresh look at our beliefs about literary fame by examining how it actually comes
about. H. J. Jackson wrestles with entrenched notions about recognizing genius and the test of time by
comparing the reputations of a dozen writers of the Romantic period—some famous, some forgotten. Why
are we still reading Jane Austen but not Mary Brunton, when readers in their own day sometimes couldn’t
tell their works apart? Why Keats and not Barry Cornwall, who came from the same circle of writers and had
the same mentor? Why not that mentor, Leigh Hunt, himself?
 
Jackson offers new and unorthodox accounts of the coming-to-fame of some of Britain’s most revered
authors and compares their reputations and afterlives with those of their contemporary rivals. What she
discovers about trends, champions, institutional power, and writers’ conscious efforts to position themselves
for posterity casts fresh light on the actual processes that lead to literary fame.
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From reader reviews:

Molly Cooper:

The book Those Who Write for Immortality: Romantic Reputations and the Dream of Lasting Fame give you
a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable far more increase. Book
can being your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem along with your subject. If you can
make studying a book Those Who Write for Immortality: Romantic Reputations and the Dream of Lasting
Fame being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your
knowledge about a number of or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like open and read a e-
book Those Who Write for Immortality: Romantic Reputations and the Dream of Lasting Fame. Kinds of
book are several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about
this guide?

Martha McKee:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or the item for all people in
the world, what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Those Who Write for
Immortality: Romantic Reputations and the Dream of Lasting Fame. All type of book can you see on many
solutions. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Michelle Huffman:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a guide you will get new information because book is one of several ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially fictional works book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
people do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this Those Who
Write for Immortality: Romantic Reputations and the Dream of Lasting Fame, it is possible to tells your
family, friends and soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a e-
book.

Jenny Perez:

This Those Who Write for Immortality: Romantic Reputations and the Dream of Lasting Fame is brand-new
way for you who has interest to look for some information as it relief your hunger of information. Getting
deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having little digest in reading
this Those Who Write for Immortality: Romantic Reputations and the Dream of Lasting Fame can be the
light food to suit your needs because the information inside this book is easy to get through anyone. These



books build itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book form. People who
think that in publication form make them feel tired even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So you cannot find
any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you
actually. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book type for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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