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Since its inception by Professor Lotfi Zadeh about 18 years ago, the theory of fuzzy sets has evolved in many
directions, and is finding applications in a wide variety of fields in which the phenomena under study are too
complex or too ill-defined to be analyzed by conventional techniques. Thus, by providing a basis for a
systematic approach to approximate reasoning and inexact inference, the theory of fuzzy sets may well have
a substantial impact on scientific methodology in the years ahead, particularly in the realms of psychology,
economics, engineering, law, medicine, decision-analysis, information retrieval, and artificial intelli gence.
This volume consists of 24 selected papers invited by the editor, Professor Paul P. Wang. These papers cover
the theory and applications of fuzzy sets, almost equal in number. We are very fortunate to have Professor A.
Kaufmann to contribute an overview paper of the advances in fuzzy sets. One special feature of this volume
is the strong participation of Chinese researchers in this area. The fact is that Chinese mathematicians,
scientists and engineers have made important contributions to the theory and applications of fuzzy sets
through the past decade. However, not until the visit of Professor A. Kaufmann to China in 1974 and again
in 1980, did the Western World become fully aware of the important work of Chinese researchers. Now,
Professor Paul Wang has initiated the effort to document these important contributions in this volume to
expose them to the western researchers.
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Sandoval:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they take because their hobby will be reading a book. How about the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will need this Advances in Fuzzy Sets, Possibility Theory, and Applications.

Brandon Li:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Advances in Fuzzy Sets, Possibility Theory, and
Applications, you can enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of
hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout people. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its called
reading friends.

Frank Bullard:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this publication. This Advances in Fuzzy Sets, Possibility
Theory, and Applications is simple bringing you can read it in the park, in the beach, train along with soon.
If you did not have much space to bring the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you
quicker to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you
will get when you buy this book.

Mark Carlton:

You can get this Advances in Fuzzy Sets, Possibility Theory, and Applications by go to the bookstore or
Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for your
knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only by simply written or printed but additionally can you
enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking by your local mobile
phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your
guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to
choose appropriate ways for you.
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