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Thoroughly revised and fully updated, the second edition of Sarah Nettleton's book will prove invaluable to
anyone looking for a clear and accessible introduction to key contemporary debates within the sociology of
health and illness. The book builds on the first edition's success, integrating the core tenets of traditional
medical sociology with some fresh insights from the current literature. New material is found throughout ,
including discussions of the new genetics, food and eating, e-health, the MMR debate, embryo stem cell
research, recent approaches to health inequalities, and the health implications of the information age.
Carefully annotated suggested further readings have been added to each chapter, to help extend students'
learning and thinking. The book aims to provide students with a thorough grounding in the area of the
sociology of health and illness. As such it covers a diversity of topics and draws on a wide range of analytic
approaches. The text spans issues such as the social construction of medical knowledge, the analysis of lay
health knowledge and beliefs, concepts of lifestyles and risk, the experience of illness and the sociology of
the body. It also explores matters which are central to health policy, such as professional-patient
relationships, health inequalities and the changing nature of health care work. A central theme which runs
throughout the book is that we are moving towards a new paradigm of health and health care, one in which
people are no longer passive recipients of treatment when they are ill, but are active participants in the
maintenance of their own health. This is reflected in contemporary health policy which emphasizes health
promotion, community health care and consumerism. The book is written primarily for students of thte social
sciences who opt to study the field of health and illness in greater depth, but will also appeal to students
taking vocational degrees requiring a sociological grounding in the area.
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Guy:

This The Sociology of Health and Illness book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is
in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is information inside this publication incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get.
This particular The Sociology of Health and Illness without we realize teach the one who studying it become
critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't be worry The Sociology of Health and Illness can bring once you are
and not make your tote space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop
even mobile phone. This The Sociology of Health and Illness having very good arrangement in word and
layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Christopher Hill:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specially book
entitled The Sociology of Health and Illness your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
most aspect that maybe unknown for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging each and every
word written in a reserve then become one application form conclusion and explanation which maybe you
never get ahead of. The The Sociology of Health and Illness giving you yet another experience more than
blown away your mind but also giving you useful info for your better life in this era. So now let us show you
the relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished
examining it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time
activity?

Jennifer Stephens:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make someone
to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler to share.
You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon. You will
observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to
your account is The Sociology of Health and Illness this book consist a lot of the information in the condition
of this world now. That book was represented how does the world has grown up. The words styles that writer
require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some research when he makes this book. That is
why this book acceptable all of you.

Georgia Cunningham:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside along with friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright
you can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like The Sociology of Health
and Illness which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's view.
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